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E
ducational institu-
tions have to keep
up with new trends

every placement season.
This year, while most man-
agement institutions are
seeing fairly good place-
ments, the skill require-
ments of companies are on
the rise. This time around,
recruiters are actively seek-
ing students who have
knowledge of Arti�cial In-
telligence (AI) and
technology.

“The placements are
slightly better than last
year. Nevertheless, we have
had around 92% place-
ments for management this
year. The expectations of
recruiting companies have
changed as they want stu-
dents to have a know-how
of things like Generative AI,
and other basic technologi-
cal skills,” said Preethi
Bhandari, Head of Corpo-
rate Relations, Jain Group
of Institutions ( JGI). 

Some institutions said
that while all companies do
not have such require-

ments, IT and other compa-
nies whose core is technol-
ogy, mandate them. 

“We have observed that
IT companies usually want
even management grad-
uates to have a fair idea of
technology for recruit-
ment. In general, keeping
in mind the current state of
the market and downsizing
in companies, there are ma-
ny challenges in place-

ments this year. We are also
seeing that companies are
not visiting on the speci�ed
dates, or some are not re-
cruiting as promised,” said
Shobha. D.V., placement
coordinator, St. Joseph’s In-
stitute of Management. 

With the rising domi-
nance of technology in ev-
ery sector, some institu-
tions say they had begun
training students of all

courses in such subjects ov-
er the last two years. 

“We were ahead of the
curve, and we trained our
students across the man-
agement spectrum in sub-
jects like data manage-
ment, big data and others.
We are seeing a very good
placement season and a lot
of companies which were
previously looking at hiring
from Indian Institutes of
Management (IIMs) are
looking at institutions like
ours where the gestation
period and the time it takes
for students to start work-
ing is usually shorter,” said
Monisha Aluvilla, who
heads the o�ce of place-
ments and career guidance
for management studies at
Christ University. 

Over 640 o�ers at IIMB 
Meanwhile, the Indian In-
stitute of Management Ban-
galore, said that despite it
being a tough year globally,
a record of more than 640
o�ers have been received
by 580 students from mar-
quee companies while 23
more students are in the
placement process. 

Now, recruiters seek
management students
adept at handling tech, AI 
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With the rising use of technology in every sector, some educational institutions have begun

training students in tech subjects for the last couple of years
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The professional attitudes
of Generation-Z (Gen-Z)
have been a matter of dis-
cussion for a few years now
as more students of the
generation graduate and
enter the workforce. The
placement o�cers in col-
leges and universities have
seen a new trend where
graduates are being o�ered
internships instead of job
o�ers to assess their
professionalism.

Corporate companies
now prefer to get to know
their candidates through
three-to-six-month intern-
ships rather than conduct
a one-time interview. 

“These days, everyone
is ‘AI-enabled’, and stu-
dents are tactically trained
for 20-minute interviews.
But the real calibre of can-
didates can only be as-
sessed when they work in
an organisation,” ex-
plained Monisha Aluvilla,
who heads the o�ce of
placements and career gui-
dance for management
studies at Christ University. 

The new norm is both
appreciated and viewed as
a challenge by educational
institutions. 

For instance, Augustine
George, Principal, Kristu
Jayanti College, Autono-
mous, said that this norm
encourages students to de-
velop their skills. “Compa-

nies prefer to train stu-
dents during internships
and then absorb them
based on performance. It
keeps the students in the
right direction as they have
to prove that they are com-
petent to work in the com-
pany. This happens mostly
for management and com-
merce students, and we
generally see a 90% con-
version rate,” he said. 

No guarantees
The placement o�cers of a
few other educational in-
stitutions said that this sit-
uation often leads to con-
cerns among both students
and colleges as there is no
guarantee about conver-
sion. 

Some also face issues
with stipend which can
range anywhere from
around ₹25,000 to
₹50,000 on an average.

Such colleges reported a
conversion rate of 60 to
70%. 

IT industry
While this seems to be a
new trend for manage-
ment and other courses, it
has been a common prac-
tice in IT industry for a few
years now. 

“In the last few years, IT
companies have been of-
fering internships �rst to
check the performance of
the students before mak-
ing them a job o�er. The
students are also aware
that they need to perform
and cannot get internships
easily. We also do an orien-
tation programme about
the ways of recruitment
and a majority of our stu-
dents get job o�ers after in-
ternships,” said K.S. Srid-
har, Dean of Placements,
PES University. 

Gen-Z students being o�ered
internships before permanent jobs 
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Corporate companies now prefer to get to know their candidates

through three-to-six-month internships rather than conduct a

one-time interview. FILE PHOTO

Kaushlendra Narayan, Di-
rector (Operations) of Sil-
verspark Apparel Ltd. (A
Raymond Initiative), em-
phasised the importance
of women’s participation
in sustainable develop-
ment for India to become a
developed nation.

While inaugurating ER-
MA-2025, a two-day Inter-
national Conference based
on the theme ‘Sustainable
Business Practices: Institu-
tional Responsibilities and
Opportunities’, organised
by the Department of Man-
agement Studies (MBA),
Nitte Meenakshi Institute
of Technology (NMIT), re-
cently, Mr. Narayan
stressed that achieving na-
tional progress would re-
quire the dedication and
e�orts of all genders, with
women playing a crucial
role.

Demand for sustainable
products and services
He further highlighted the
growing demand for sus-
tainable products and ser-
vices among consumers.
He noted that companies
committed to sustainabili-
ty are better positioned to
build stronger brands, fos-
ter customer loyalty, and
gain a competitive edge. 

ERMA-2025
International
Conference
held at NMIT 
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Union Bank of India host-
ed an MSME Outreach

Camp in Hoskote on Mon-
day, to support the growth
of Micro, Small, and Medi-
um Enterprises (MSMEs)
in the region. The event

aimed to encourage entre-
preneurship, promote go-
vernment schemes, and
provide essential �nancial
assistance to local

na), Jeevan Jyoti Bima
Yojana, and retail CASA
services were also made
available to the visitors.

The event saw over 500

bene�ciaries, with 351
loan accounts sanctioned,
totalling ₹476 crore. Loan
sanction letters were dis-
tributed to the recipients.

ment-backed schemes like
PMMY (Pradhan Mantri
Mudra Yojana), PM Vish-
wakarma, PMJDY (Prad-
han Mantri Jan Dhan Yoja-

o�ered specialised MSME
loans to women entrepre-
neurs through the ‘Union
Nari Shakti’ initiative. Ad-
ditionally, key govern-

businesses.
At the camp, the bank

sanctioned collateral-free
loans under the ‘Union
MSE Support’ scheme and

Union Bank of India sanctions ₹476 crore in loans at MSME Outreach Camp at Hoskote 
The Hindu Bureau
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